
Detached Villa for sale in Calahonda, Mijas 699 995 €
Référence: RS20353  Chambres: 4  Bain: 3  Terrain: 420m  Construite: 157m2 2
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Costa del Sol, Calahonda

Key-Ready 4-Bed Villa in Calahonda Near the BeachThis detached four-bedroom villa is located in one of western
Calahonda's most desirable residen5al areas, just a short walk from the beach and local shops, yet tucked away on a
peaceful street. Part of an exclusive community of just nine villas sharing a communal pool, this is the most private
property in the development.Inside, the villa is bright and welcoming, featuring a spacious lounge with a feature
fireplace, a fully independent kitchen, and three well-sized double bedrooms with fi;ed wardrobes on the main floor—
one of which is a master with ensuite. The lounge opens directly onto a sunny south-facing patio that wraps around the
property, connec5ng to a private lawn and garden area with a storage shed. A large outdoor u5lity room with washer
and dryer adds prac5cality to the layout.As a bonus feature, this property includes an upper level accessed via an
internal staircase, offering a spacious and versa5le area that adds real value to the home. Currently used as a fourth
bedroom, this bright and open space includes a bathroom and opens onto a large private terrace with beau5ful sea
views — the perfect spot to unwind or entertain. Whether you're thinking of a home office, a music or art studio, a
stylish second lounge, a home gym, or a games room, this flexible space can be tailored to suit your lifestyle
needs.With marble floors, double glazing, air condi5oning, private garage and fibre op5c internet, the home is stylishly
presented and key-ready. This charming villa is an ideal turnkey purchase in a top loca5on.Summary:Detached 4-
bedroom villa in western CalahondaWalking distance to beach, shops, and ameni5esQuiet street in a community of 9
villas sharing a poolMost private posi5on in the complexPrivate garage with electric doorSpacious lounge with
fireplace and independent kitchenMain floor with 3 bedrooms and 2 bathrooms (1 ensuite)Master suite upstairs with
private sea-view terraceSouth-facing pa5o and lawn with garden shedOutdoor u5lity room with washer and
dryerMarble floors, air conditioning, double glazingFibre optic internet and key-ready to move in
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