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Axarquía, Periana

HIGHLIGHTS Casa Rosa is far more than a home: it is a cap/va/ng theatrical backdrop infused with Tuscan charm,
designed to host grand family celebra/ons or to enjoy everyday family life. This sanctuary of peace, beauty, and
authen/city nestles gracefully among the rolling hills of Andalucía, just moments from the enchan/ng ar/s/c village of
Periana. Masterfully cra9ed by renowned architect César de Leyva, Casa Rosa’s architecture harmoniously blends the
classical elegance of Roman design with the intricate ornamental beauty of the Alhambra. All this is seamlessly
combined with the finest contemporary comforts, creating a serene and luxurious retreat. This estate is perfectly suited
for families and friends seeking spacious living, abundant leisure op/ons, and a deep connec/on to nature.
INTRODUCING THE PROPERTY Just 45 minutes from Málaga Interna/onal Airport and a short drive to the golden
sands of the Costa del Sol, Casa Rosa offers the rare fusion of serene privacy and effortless accessibility. Situated near
Periana, a picturesque whitewashed village famed for its ar/s/c spirit and bohemian charm, the estate serves as both a
cherished family home and a successful vaca/on rental. Periana’s lively social scene revolves around its shaded plaza
and offers an array of clubs, cultural ac/vi/es, language groups, walking tours, riding schools, and art classes. Outdoor
enthusiasts will relish the scenic cycling routes, horseback riding trails, and nearby yoga retreats, while culture lovers
can explore nearby gems such as Granada, Málaga, Frigiliana, and Lake Viñuela. Set on an expansive 14 hectares of
private land doJed with over 800 mature olive trees, Casa Rosa offers unparalleled privacy and self-sufficiency,
including the unique opportunity to produce your own premium extra virgin olive oil annually. The property comprises
a stunning main residence and a charming detached guest house, enveloped by me/culously landscaped gardens, a
sparkling swimming pool, a full-size tennis court, and breathtaking panoramic views of the pris/ne Andalusian
countryside. Here, luxury meets tranquility in a seLng that feels worlds away yet remains conveniently close to
Periana, Málaga, and the vibrant Costa del Sol. EXTERIOR The outdoor spaces at Casa Rosa are thoughNully designed
for both relaxa/on and entertainment. The invi/ng swimming pool, framed by lush mature gardens and elegant
Roman-style pa/os, offers an idyllic seLng for sunbathing, swimming, or dining under the stars. Several shaded
terraces provide in/mate corners for reading, unwinding, or savoring a glass of local wine while watching the sunset.
Sports enthusiasts will appreciate the professional-size tennis court, perfect for friendly matches or serious prac/ce.
The estate’s extensive olive groves are carefully tended by a local farmer, ensuring an annual harvest of excep/onal
extra virgin olive oil, a true taste of Andalusian heritage. The detached guest house, affec/onately known as “Rosita,” is
fully equipped with a bedroom, kitchen, and bathroom, ideal for visitors, staff, or as a private studio. INTERIOR Inside
Casa Rosa, six spacious bedrooms are thoughNully arranged across separate wings, each featuring private ensuite
bathrooms to ensure comfort and privacy for family and guests alike. The interiors are a rich tapestry of Roman,
Moorish, and Eastern influences, crea/ng an elegant yet warm and invi/ng atmosphere. Modern ameni/es such as
underfloor hea/ng and central air condi/oning guarantee year-round comfort, while the main living room opens onto
stunning views of the gardens, pool, and olive groves. The kitchen and dining areas are designed as the heart of the
home, perfect for gathering and crea/ng las/ng memories. High-speed Wi-Fi connec/vity allows you to stay
connected effortlessly without disrup/ng the estate’s peaceful ambiance. AN EXCEPTIONAL OPPORTUNITY Casa
Rosa’s design encourages relaxed outdoor living, with mul/ple pa/os perfect for al fresco dining and enjoying the
gentle Andalusian breeze. This property is truly a private retreat where /meless Andalusian calm and authen/city meet
modern luxury. Currently opera/ng as a private residence with an impressive track record as a vaca/on rental, Casa
Rosa offers, not only an extraordinary lifestyle but also a sustainable income opportunity. Whether you seek a
luxurious family estate, a serene retreat, or a profitable holiday rental, Casa Rosa promises a unique blend of elegance,
tranquility, and authentic Andalusian living.
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Features:
Features 
Covered Terrace 
Private Terrace 
Storage Room 
Ensuite Bathroom 
Fitted Wardrobes 
Paddle Tennis 
Guest Apartment 
Utility Room 
Basement 

Orientation 
South 

Climate Control 
Air Conditioning 
Fireplace 
Central Heating 
U/F Heating 

Views 
Panoramic 
Country 
Garden 
Pool 

Condition 
Excellent 

Pool 
Private 

Furniture 
Not Furnished 
Optional 

Garden 
Private 

Security 
Alarm System 

Parking 
Private 
More Than One 

Utilities 
Solar water heating 

Category 
Luxury 

Energy Rating 
E 

CO2 Emission Rating 
E 

sales@redrosepropertyspain.com 
+34-602 627 580 

Red Rose Properties | +34-602 627 580 | sales@redrosepropertyspain.com

Page: 3 / 3


	Other for sale in Periana, Periana
	1,800,000 €
	Axarquía, Periana
	Features:


